
A Wish Blown out of Proportion
In this story, Mia found a wish granting genie, often overlooked for her short stature and plain 
body, Mia makes a wish that’s sure to get her noticed by her crush….

Be sure to check the Tags and I hope you enjoy the story!

—----------------------

“I wish for a body that my crush Chris will find irresistible!” Mia blurted out as the Genie looked 
on expectantly. Mia got nervous as the Genie didn't react for three long, drawn out seconds, her 
sheer robes swaying gently as if there was a breeze. Finally, the mythical being smirked.

“Clever girl, I like you.” She raised her hand up, fingers pressed together, “I will grant you this 
wish!” She declared, the snapping of her fingers like a whip crack that resonated throughout 
Mia's very being as the Genie’s eyes glowed with a soft white light. Mia’s breath hitched in her 
throat, waiting for…something...to happen but as the Genie floated there unmoving Mia grew 
concerned..

“Uhh is anything going to happen?” Mia asked cautiously, still uncertain of the being before her, 
genies are often tricksters and malicious in folk tales.

“A moment Master, you humans have been quite busy in the centuries since I was last 
summoned, I must ensure I find the correct ‘Chris’ for this wish.” The Genie responded very 
matter-of-factly.

“Oh, his last name is ‘Arneal’, he's in a few of my college classes, English Lit and my Life 
Drawing classes if that helps?” Mia offered, still a bit unsure of the whole situation. The Genie 
nodded, “It does indeed Master, please wait but a moment longer.” she requested flatly.

Mia doesn't mind waiting but there was something else that was starting to bug her, “Actually, 
one more thing, you can just call me Mia, the whole ‘Master’ bit is kinda creepy.” She asked, the
Genie simply nodded, “Very well Mia.” the Genie stressed the syllables in Mai’s name playfully.

A stretch of silence hung in the air before the glow in the Genie's eyes dimmed and then went 
out entirely. “Oh my Mia, your wish is clever but I wonder if you truly know Chris as well as you 
ought to for such a wish...” The Genie chided Mia.

Mia scoffed, “I'm no stranger to the wants of men, when you're as small and flat as me assholes
are more than willing to pass on me just because some other bitch can show off some 
cleavage.” Resentment and anger worked into Mia’s tone as she countered the Genie’s jab at 
her.

Mia was only 5’1”,the Genie unknowingly mocked Mia’s own height simply by being over 6’ tall. 
And the torment didn't end there, though the Genie was adorned in a long draping robe it’s 
sheer fabric did little to hide her assets, large breasts and hips that managed to push out the 



robe even wider as it draped from her shoulders, Mia didn't need to see her ass to know it would
be proportional in size as well.

The Genie smiled, “I am glad to see you are determined Mia, let us get started then!” the genie 
announced raising her hand again and snapping her fingers. It wasn't nearly as loud this time 
yet Mia didn't have a chance to realize that it had the same resonant quality as the first finger 
snap due to the Genie suddenly standing naked before her!

Mia hadn't even finished opening her mouth to question the Genie before she snapped her 
fingers again, this time Mia didn't see any changes, until she felt a bit of a breeze across her 
skin, all of her skin.

“WhaaaAAAAT-ARE-YOU DOING?” Mia squeaked as she shot her hands in front of her nipples 
and crotch, suddenly just as exposed as the Genie standing before her. She did her best to 
glare at the mythical being standing before her but her nudity and short stature weren't exactly 
doing her any favors in trying to intimidate a wish granting genie.

“Calm yourself Mia, your body is pleasurable to look upon but the reality is that our clothes will 
simply get in the way of me granting you your wish is all.” the Genie explained.

Mia’s body loosened up as she overcame the initial panic, taking the time to take in the genie’s 
body Mia felt her jealousy flare up again. With no robes left to cover the Genie’s body Mia could 
take it all in. Her Breasts were enormous, reaching a section of the alphabet that simply didn't 
exist yet on a human scale. Most curious was how they managed to stay perky in spite of their 
size, each one was almost as big as her head yet they didn't droop or sag. Nor did they have 
the firm shape that came with implants, they simply looked natural in spite of their size.

Her breasts were also capped by a pair of very large, plump nipples, as thick as her thumb and 
almost as long. Mia’s eyes drifted downwards, her stomach was flat with the barest hint of abs 
before flowing outward into the widest and fullest hips she'd ever seen. Nestled between those 
was a plump pussy, completely hairless to boot.

Before Mia got a chance to try and get an angle on the Genie’s ass the Genie spoke up. “Let us 
begin!” the genie said excitedly as she stepped forward, taking Mia’s face in her hands and 
angling her face upwards, the genie leaned down and their lips met in a slow but forceful kiss. 
Mia was too shocked to react, even just the genie touching her face set her skin tingling and her
heart all aflutter, the kiss was unlike anything she'd experienced before, her lips were infused 
with a heat she’d never felt before and it quickly spread to her entire body. Mia closed her eyes 
and just went along with it, her own arousal quickly building up as the Genie held the kiss.

Mia felt the flow of something into her, not like a liquid or anything physical but like an energy, a 
sense of power. After what felt like simultaneously hours and a split second the genie broke the 
kiss, stopping the flow and as Mia opened her eyes she immediately felt off balance. “Wo-woah,
what was that all ab-aaahh!” Mia started to question the genie but an intense wave of vertigo 
swept over her and she started to fall.



“Easy there!” The Genie reassured as she reached out and caught Mia, her grip firm and 
completely unyielding, catching her effortlessly and easing her back upright. “Uhhh…what did 
you do to me?” Mia questioned the Genie as she looked around but couldn't shake the feeling 
that something was off.

“I have simply granted your wish.” The Genie paused for a second, “Well to be more accurate I 
have granted the first part of your wish, I have always believed that wishes are more personal 
when I can help my masters experience them in some way rather than just granting them 
without fanfare.” The genie seemed quite pleased with herself, as if she was proud of the 
service she was providing?

“So that power I felt flowing into me, that was you?” Mias asked, still unsure what was off now. 
The Genie smiled, “You are a clever one, yes that was me granting upon you the first part of 
your wish, here, see for yourself!” the genie prodded Mia as she released her and stepped back.

The disorientation was gone but Mia looked around trying to figure out what had changed but it 
wasn't until she turned her focus back to the Genie to ask her to explain that it clicked for her. 
“You made me taller!” Mia nearly shouted as she was now looking into the genie's eyes straight 
on!

“Correct again Mia, you now stand as tall as I do, six feet and three inches tall as I believe you 
would say.” The genie explained as Mia looked around again, now fully grasping the difference 
in height after having grown fourteen inches taller, her perspective on the room around her 
completely new.

“I guess you weren't kidding about the clothes…” Mia muttered as she looked herself over. She 
was glad to see she hadn't just been ‘stretched out’ and actually had a very similar build to what 
she had before, just…taller now.

The genie piped up as Mia inspected herself, “You are lucky this ‘Chris’ enjoys his women taller, 
there are many who might have preferred you to be even shorter than you were before.” The 
genie explained to a still distracted Mia.

“I need a mirror!” Mia declared as she started marching towards her bedroom and the full length
mirror she had in there. Her first few steps were uncertain and wobbly but by the time she 
walked into her bedroom and turned on the light she'd mostly gotten the hang of her new size. 
There was a slight problem with the mirror, when she got it she'd mounted it based on her old 
height, so most of her head was cut off by the top of the mirror ending.

Nonetheless Mia liked everything that she saw. She was a little disappointed she was still as flat
as they came but if this let her get noticed by Chris it'd be worth it. She hadn't noticed that the 
genie had followed her to the bedroom until she spoke up, “I take it you are satisfied Mia?” She 
asked.

“Absolutely!” Mia turned towards the genie and beamed a huge smile at her. “The only trouble is
going to be finding something to fit so I can go out and get new clothes…” Mia mused as the 



genie stepped closer.

“Excellent, then allow us to continue granting your wish!” The genie declared, grabbing Mia by 
the shoulders and firmly guiding her to the bed and getting her to sit along its edge.

“Wai….wait, there's more!?” Mia ASKED as the genie’s hands remained on her shoulders.

“Of course Mia, people can be fickle, a single attribute is almost never enough to make one 
irresistible as you wished.” The genie raised one of her hands, quickly snapping her fingers. Mia
looks down at herself and doesn't see any changes but as she looks back up at the genie she 
notes that her breathing was getting a bit rougher.

Mia barely hears the Genie mutter “This is my favorite part…” as the genie lowers her hand 
down to her crotch and starts to tease her folds, Mia is uncomfortably close to eye level with the 
Genie’s crotch but can't seem to look away, she'd never really considered herself to be Bi, but 
as she watched her arousal rumbled onwards with no sign of stopping.

”Ah….here we…go!” The Genie panted out as her fingers started to focus on her clit, her long…
swollen…clit. No, it wasn't merely swollen, it was growing! Mia sat entranced as it grew longer 
and thicker, it wasn't long until the genies wrapped her fingers around it, at first just to hold it but
as it continued to grow she was able to start stroking it along its ever growing length. Once it 
reached about six inches long the growth started to slow but the clit started to pulse and throb, a
hard ridge appearing near the tip and growing into a huge glans. Mia also spotted bulging veins 
forming as the Genie pumped what was clearly her new eight inch dick.

“Mmmmmmm yeah…that's always the best feeling.” the Genie moaned as the growth ended. 
The Genie was silent as she simply slowly pumped her cock, the tip now very close to Mia's 
face, a bead of precum already forming at the tip.

“Wha……why?!?” Was all Mia could gasp out, the genie's grip on her should still firm, 
preventing her from backing away in any meaningful way. The Genie smirked as she looked 
down at Mia, “All part of the experience dear, you liked our kiss didn't you?” The genie asked, 
tilting her head as she awaited an answer from her.

“Well, yes…of course! You…uh…are very good at uh kissing!” Mia stammered out, concerns of 
her well being at the hands of this mythical creature starting to cloud her mind as the assorted 
unhappy endings from folk tales were remembered.

The Genie laughed, “Thank you Mia, I'm glad you liked it, but believe me when I say it was only 
the beginning my dear!” she lowered her voice to a sultry whisper and leaned forward, “I am 
very experienced in the pleasures of the flesh, the remaining aspects of your wish will bring you 
to new heights of pleasure.” The Genie divulged, Mia could clearly hear a hint of excitement for 
what was to come in the Genie’s voice.

The Genie pulled back a bit, “I sense that you are tense, worry not Mia, I will not bring you to 
harm, only pleasure in the granting of your wish, now are you ready to continue?” the Genie 



asked as she started to languidly pump her dick again.

Mia sat there conflicted, she hadn't lied, the kiss was good, and the genie didn't seem to have 
malicious intent at least, well either that or Mia was a terrible judge of character. It didn't really 
seem like she had a way out of the situation though, the wish will be granted, and what's wrong 
with getting something out of the act of having it granted as well?

Mia took a deep breath, “Alright Genie you can continue.” Mia announced looking at the genie 
with as much determination as she could muster given her honestly compromised position.

The Genie smiled brightly, “Excellent, now open wide…” she directed and Mia did so, almost 
instinctively angling her head back to give the Genie better access, only realizing 
subconsciously what was about to happen too late to say anything before the genie eased her 
hips forward and slid her glans right into her mouth.

Like with the kiss her glans had a heat, a deep warmth to it, somehow it also tasted…good? The
glans rested in her mouth, having been pushed past her lips and resting on her tongue, she felt 
the genie's precum landing on her tongue as well. After a moment of being surprised she started
to move her tongue, lapping and any part of the genie's dick it could reach. Above her the genie 
moaned appreciatively.

“Mia I am glad to see how eager you are, I hope you are ready for more.” The genie quipped as 
her free hand reached behind her head and started to push her further down her dick. Mia had 
never really deepthroated a guy before, but then she’d never given a blowjob to anyone so 
well…endowed…

The genie's dick slipped down her throat almost effortlessly, the growing heat radiating out from 
the dick more and more as she managed to swallow the entire length.

“I love it when a girl can go all the way…” The genie teased as Mia's lips met her crotch. The 
Genie gave a gentle tug on the back of Mia's head, understanding immediately she started 
blowing the hung genie in earnest, quickly pumping the Genie’s cock in and out of her mouth. 
As she did so Mia felt that power flowing into her again.

Not caught off guard this time she focuses on the feeling, how it's spreading out to every part of 
her body, the heat spreading out with it. This time Mia can feel it pooling in certain places more 
so than others. The biggest Hotspot seems to be her hips, one of her hands drifted down to feel 
them and she continued pleasuring the genie with her mouth.

As her hand touched her thigh she could feel the heat collecting there. More importantly though,
she felt even more thigh there than there ought to be. Her prior growth hadn't really changed 
how thin she was relative to her height, but now it felt like there was simply more flesh, and as 
she rested her for a second she swore she felt her fingers being spread out as more thigh grew 
out of nowhere.

Above her the Genie was enjoying her blowjob, moans and murmurs of appreciation drifted 



down to Mia as she continued to work on the Genie's cock. Her tongue worked to tease 
whatever part of the cock it could reach as it slid in and out of her throat. Mia was slightly 
distracted, while her thighs seemed to be the largest hot spot as more power flowed into her 
from the Genie, there was another one of note that came to her attention, her chest.

Her hand left her thigh and drifted upwards. Sliding up her stomach she felt something she 
hadn't before, a breast. Mia couldn't look down at the moment, but she moaned as her hand 
explored what she had previously called her “barely-theres”. Now though there was enough 
flesh to cup them and squeeze them. It wasn't a lot, Mia figured they might be B-cups at the 
moment, but like her thighs they were growing as the blowjob continued.

Mia jumped a bit as she felt the genie pushing at her forehead lightly, “You're very good at this, 
but that's enough for now.” The genie beamed as she slowly pulled her cock first from Mia's 
throat, then her mouth, a small pop as she pulled the head free from her lips. The Genie's cock 
was throbbing, precum slowly pooled at the tip until it dripped away. Her pussy was also quite 
wet, rivulets of her juices flowing down her legs. Mia's breathing was labored, yet somehow she 
didn't feel nearly as worn out as she expected.

“You are quite skilled at that Mia, much longer and you’d have made me cum for sure, but that is
enough growth for now.” The Genie teased, stepping back from Mia as her fingers gingerly 
teasing her cock. “You probably want to see the new you correct?” The Genie tempted Mia, 
gesturing towards the mirror with her free hand.

“Oo…oh, uh sure!” Mia squeaked, caught off guard by her new voice. Her voice had been, 
much like her previous voice, small and unassuming, but how it was deeper, with that grain of 
texture that made it sound about as sexy as a voice could be.

“Fuck...I feel like I could make a man cum just by whispering in his ear…” Mia marveled as she 
got used to her new voice, her hand finding its way to her throat and resting on it.

The Genie chuckled, “Perhaps not so with all men, but I’m sure you’ll find Chris to be rather…
receptive to it.” the genie purred as Mia stepped back in front of the mirror.

Mia gasped as she took in her reflection. She had always been fairly thin, even after gaining her
new height, but how she had actual curves!As she had felt during the blowjob, her thighs had 
seen most of the growth leaving her with ‘bottom heavy’ proportions as her chest hadn’t grown 
as much. Turning her attention to her chest she was still very pleased with their growth, from 
‘barely theres’ to ‘Bumping Bs’. Mia would have liked to see them grow a bit more, something 
like a solid C-cup would have been nice but any increase in size was better than what she had 
before. The genie had basically filled her out a bit, the woman reflected back to Mia in the mirror
wasn’t thin, but rather curvy.

But something caught her eye as she inspected her chest, Mia bent down to get a better view of
her face in the mirror and was surprised to see how full her lips were! She rang her tongue 
along them, a shiver running down her spine.



Mia turned to the Genie, “You made them more sensitive?” she asked of the mythical being as 
she stood nearby gently teasing her shaft as she gazed upon Mia.

“Oh yes,” the genie mewled, “blowjobs are a treat unlike any other for men, I see no reason for 
you to not enjoy them as well!” she explained as if it was the most obvious thing in the world. 
Honestly, Mia couldn’t argue with the logic to a certain degree. Standing back up to her new 
height Mia looked over herself in the mirror once more. While the lips had been a bit of a 
surprise she also realized her hair was longer and felt silky smooth as she ran her fingers 
through it. Before her hair didn’t even come down to her shoulders, but now seemed to reach 
halfway down her back.

She was pleased to see nothing about her new body was crazy, folk tales or not, the idea of 
being tricked or manipulated by the Genie had worried her at first. Twisting her hips to see her 
ass, Mia would have liked it to be a bit bigger, it seemed a bit small compared to her new hips.

The Genie surprised Mia by playfully whispering in her ear, “Something on your mind?” Mia 
jumped, having not realized that the Genie had gotten that close. Mia could practically hear the 
smirk in the Genie’s tone.

Mia took a half step back before responding. “Ah well, this is all great, I’d never imagined having
a body this sexy, I was just…surprised I suppose…that my ass hadn’t grown as much compared
to the rest of me.” Mia carefully explained, not wanting to feel like she was criticizing the Genie’s
wish granting..

“Oh rest assured I am not done granting your wish yet Mia!” The genie then smiled as if 
explaining something so basic as to be obvious to everyone. “If you are concerned about your 
ass, we can work on that next if you desire.” the Genie offered as Mia was stunned to silence.

“The…there's still more!? Mia yelping in a mix of shock and panic. The Genie stepped forward  
and Mia swore she felt heat radiating from the genie’s dick as she got closer. “Of course Mia, as
I explained before, no single asset can make you irresistible, ergo to grant your wish I will be 
enhancing as many assets as I can to best fulfill Chris’ carnal desires and make you an 
irresistible partner.” revealed the Genie.

Mia swallowed as her mind raced, what the Genie had said before flashed in her mind, whether 
she knew Chris well enough for this kind of wish. Sure her lips were nice and not too big, but if 
the genie had more to do, and was focusing on different assets guys find attractive the worst 
might be yet to come.

“So…uhh…what's next then?” Mia stammered as she tried to not stress about getting the rest of
her wish.

The Genie clapped her hands together, “Well if you are concerned about your ass that would be
a wonderful next step to granting your wish, do you prefer receiving anal on your back or doggy 
style?” The genie's question was asked with complete innocence, as if it were the most normal 
thing to ask someone.



“Woah you can’t fuck me in the ass! I've never…I mean your cock would never fit, it's huge!” Mia
panicked. She had considered anal in the past, but only as a means to try and get a guy but had
never gone through with it.

The Genie seemed disappointed, “Oh? I had no intention of harming you Mia, here let me 
just…” the genie raised her hand as she spoke, giving Mia the hope that she had managed to 
avoid having her ass get destroyed by the genie's cock. The genie snapped her fingers and Mia 
was relieved at first but quickly noticed that she hadn't felt anything, quickly brushing a hand 
against her butt it didn't feel any bigger…

“There, this size should be more suitable for you!” The genie gleefully announced, Mia pausing 
before looking downward towards the Genie’s cock. It was admittedly much smaller, about five 
inches long and not nearly as thick as it was mere moments ago. “Now, which position would 
you prefer?” The genie asked with a smoldering gaze that left Mia mentally off balance.

“Uhhhh…” Mia drawled as she mentally sighed, at least it's smaller now, “...doggy I guess?” Mia 
selected.

The Genie smiled, “Excellent choice.” And motioned Mia towards the bed. Mia's heart rate 
started to climb as she crawled onto the bed, her hands shaking slightly, not really sure what to 
expect from the Genie as Mia assumed the position and craned her neck to look back at the 
genie as she got into position behind her.

Mia felt the genie's soft yet immovable firm grip on her hips as she assumed her other hand 
took hold of her cock. She started by simply rubbing the now shorter length of her cock between
her cheeks and against her rosebud. She felt the heat emanating from it already, a slight buzz 
reaching beneath her skin, and it hadn't even penetrated her yet.

The Genie pulled her cock down further and she felt the ridges of its glans against her anus. 
“Please go slow…’ Mia implored, her cheeks flushing red with embarrassment. The Genie 
gently caressed her hip as she reassured her, “Of course Mia, now breathe deeply and let 
yourself relax…” the Genie guided her through some deep breaths, slowly teasing Mia's asshole
with her cock, but gently, patiently.

Suddenly, just as Mia finished exhaling, the Genie pushed forward and Mia felt the cockhead 
slip inside her anus. Mia could only moan lightly as she felt her asshole stretching open. The 
genie stopped, only an inch deep, letting Mia get used to the feeling. Mia’s arousal was already 
building up within her as the Genie's heat permeated inside her asshole.

“Are you ready for the rest now?” The Genie asked softly, Mia instinctively knew that the Genie 
would wait as long as needed, and yet…

“Yesss……” Mia moaned loudly, feeling desperate to have the rest of the Genie's cock inside 
her. The Genie didn't wait and slowly pushed her hips forward, easing the entire length of her 
short cock into Mia. Mia groaned as the Genie's hips made contact with her butt and she could 



feel the power starting to flow but unlike the last two times Mia experienced it, it didn't flow far. 
Instead it pooled right there in her ass. It seemed that this time the changes would be localized 
to just her ass.

“Can I start moving now?” the Genie quietly asked, Mia could feel it throbbing inside her. 
“Mmmmm…fuck me! Mia begged as she started to push back and grinding her ass into the 
Genie's crotch for emphasis. As the genie started pulling her hips back Mia realized that this 
probably felt better than it ought to because of the genie and the wish, but sparks flew as the 
Genie's cock started to thrust in and out of her ass and rational thought became difficult for Mia. 

The Genie was starting slow, the unfamiliar sensation gave way to moans and groans as Mia 
gripped the bed sheets tightly and the Genie slowly increased her speed. The Genie’s wide hips
started to slap into her ass with every thrust with more and more of the Genie's heat pooling into
her ass. Each thrust burying into Mia's ass seemed to flow even more power into her, it was 
beginning to feel overwhelming, as if it was running out of room back there.

Suddenly the Genie started thrusting harder into her ass, the slaps ringing loud and clear 
through the bedroom as Mia felt a spike in her arousal from it. Each thrust drove her closer and 
closer to orgasm and it wasn't long until Mia felt her ass jiggling more and more from each 
thrust.

Doing her best to raise her head and look back over her shoulder confirmed it, she could 
already tell her ass was bigger and still growing. Mia hadn't ever really been one for getting 
spanked, but the mix of discomfort and pleasure the Genie was giving her swelling ass felt 
amazing. As the Genie's grunts and her moans filled the room Mia knew that she wanted, no, 
needed more!

“Mo…more!” Mia panted out in between the Genie's thrusts. “Fret not Mia, you are due much 
more growth than this yet.” The Genie reassured her as she kept pounding away. Mia groaned, 
“No…I want…more…of you!” Mia explained, gasping to catch her breath. The Genie stopped 
her thrusting, “You truly mean it?” asked cautiously, Mia nodded vigorously and the Genie 
grinned, “My my, Mia you are simply full of surprises!” The Genie quickly snaps her fingers.

Suddenly Mia's bowels are beset by a new sensation, the Genie hasn't yet started moving again
but Mia can feel the Genie’s cock slowly pushing further into her bowels. Not only pushing 
deeper, but she can also feel it pushing outwards against her anus, stretching it wider as it 
slowly regained its lost girth. Mia choked down a moan as the Genie started thrusting again, 
quickly resuming her prior pace.

“FUCK your spreading me out so much!” Mia shouted into her sheets as the genie’s full size 
reamed her asshole wide open. The flow of power from the genie was enhanced as well and 
Mia just basked in the sensation of her ass expanding even faster than before.

Mia yelped as the genie grabbed her growing ass and started kneading her asscheeks, pushing 
her arousal into overdrive. Her orgasm was basically inevitable. “Oh man…I'm gonna cum…I'm 
gonna cum from you fucking my ass!” Mia groaned as the Genie relentlessly fucked her ass.



“Me too Mia…you ass is so…wonderfully tight…I'm gonna cum too!” the Genie echoed in a rare 
instance of her stern composure cracking as she lost herself in the pleasure of Mia’s ass. As 
strange as the idea of making a mythical creature cum was, Mia felt ecstatic at the prospect and
found her arousal spiking again, Mia’s hips bucking as her orgasm exploded within her.

“Yes do it! Cum…in…mmeeeeEEEEEEEEE!” Mia screamed as her mind went blank, barely 
registering how the Genie made a few deep thrusts before really slamming her cock in deep and
grinding her crotch in Mia’s ass as her cock throbbed and pulsed, quickly coating her bowels 
with her cum, the Genie groaning as her orgasm ran its course.

Mia's orgasm left her trembling, only the genie's grip on her expanded ass kept her from 
flopping down onto the bed. The genie regained her composure first, and started to slowly slide 
Mia off her softening cock. Mia felt it pop free of her asshole and felt a cool draft in her bowels, 
oh, my asshole is gaping she reasoned as the Genie eased her down onto the bed and turning 
her onto her side, the new mass of her ass and hips left them resting at an angle she wasn't 
familiar with.

“Fuuuuccccck you really did a number on my ass…” Mia muttered as she explored the new 
shape of her ass with her hand. The Genie simply beamed a warm smile down at her, “I simply 
granted part of the wish you asked for, though I will admit I am glad you were willing to let me 
regain my usual size, the resulting tightness was heavenly!” The Genie complimented Mia 
warmly.

Mia gave a weak laugh, “ I was worried, anal wasn't ever really something I wanted to try, but 
you made me feel so good I just wanted more I guess…” Mia reasoned as she slowly propped 
herself up on her elbow. Looking back of her new ass Mia was amazed by just how big it had 
gotten, sure before she could kind of feel how big it had gotten as the genie fucked her but 
seeing it clearly like this was something else. Reaching back she lightly grabbed a cheek, biting 
her lip and moaning quietly as she felt the pleasure shoot up to her brain. 

Groaning and she pushed herself upright Mia watched as her hips and ass spread across the 
bed. Mia had never seen a better example of “bottom heavy”, even with her bigger breasts they 
might as well not exist for how prominent her ass, hips and thighs were now. If she was going to
have trouble finding something to wear before from her wardrobe her new ass basically made it 
impossible now.

Standing up Mia was surprised to find it still just as easy in spite of the mass of her new ass, 
probably more magic trickery, like with the increased  sensitivity of her lips and ass. Taking 
careful steps as she adjusted to the new weight and sway of her hips Mia made her way back to
the mirror and took in her new curves.

This time the change was pretty extreme, her hips were almost twice as wide as they had been 
before the wish and her bubbly ass almost stuck out far enough to work as a shelf. “I never 
figured Chris to be that much of an ass man…” Mia muttered under her breath as she turned 
and shimmied in front of the mirror.



The Genie walked up beside Mia and with a swing of her hand slapped Mia’s ass “AAahhh~” 
Mia yelped, there was a bit of pain but the spike in her arousal was much more prominent and 
she tried to get her libido under control. “Worry not Mia, though many men may gaze upon a 
woman’s chest almost exclusively Chris can appreciate a woman’s whole body, you will be in 
good hands!” the genie attested confidently. Mia gently rubbed her ass where the genie had 
slapped it, “So are you done granting the wish now?” Mia asked doubtfully.

The Genie smiled, “I’m afraid not, though your body has been improved in many ways so far 
there are still some that have yet to reach their full potential, in fact…” the Genie mewled as she
dragged her back towards the bed, Mia did note that she still had her cock, though it didn’t seem
to be fully hard at the moment, maybe even Genies needed some downtime before going 
again? Mia’s train of thought was interrupted when the Genie sat her down on the edge of the 
bed, her new ass cushioning the landing and jiggling from the impact in equal parts, causing Mia
to hiss slightly as she inhaled.

“I believe we have worked down below enough for now, I shall work a bit higher this time.” the 
Genie informed her as she got down on her knees, Mia was confused for a moment but as she 
started to lean forward her mouth was making a beeline for her chest. “Still more?” Mia mouthed
as the Genie's lips latched onto her left nipple and her tongue started to caress the small nub 
within her mouth. Mia immediately felt the heat and the Genie’s power flowing into her, but even 
more so than with her ass it concentrated directly into her nipple. Well, nipples she mentally 
corrected herself as she brought her hand up to her other breast and felt the heat radiating out 
from that nipple as well.

“Oooohh~” Mia moaned as the Genie's tongue continued to play with her nipple. As she should 
have expected, their sensitivity was already more intense than it used to be. As she rolled her 
other nipple between her fingers she was already starting to feel a difference. Her nipples were 
growing thicker and longer and giving her fingers and the Genie’s tongue more and more to play
with.

Mia moaned, the Genie was really good with her tongue and this was so much better than 
anything Mia had experienced before. Without even actively thinking she leaned more into the 
Genie as she slipped her right arm between their bodies so her fingers could start playing with 
her pussy, her fingers slipping into her wet and ready depths with ease.

The Genie suddenly released her nipple with a wet pop. “I'm glad to see you're really getting 
into this now, but I'm not quite done with your nipples yet.” The Genie giggled, no doubt referring
to how Mia was pleasuring herself. Mia also got a good look at her nipple now that it was free of 
the Genie's mouth and for not being done with them yet they had grown a lot already! It was at 
least an inch and a half long and as thick as her pinky, not only that but her areola had puffed up
and spread across more of her breast. 

The Genie didn't give her much time to inspect her nipple before pushing her mouth back onto 
her breast and sending her tongue to work. The heat returned and somehow even more intense
than before.



Looking to her left nipple Mia toyed with it more slowly to better observe the growth as it was 
happening. Mia was enthralled as she watched it continue to grow. Just as before it wasn't just 
her nipples, her areola slowly spread across her breasts and puffed up, pushing her nipples 
further forward as the skin, previously a lighter pink, darkened and took on some brown tones 
ensuring they'd stand out and draw the eye any time her chest was exposed.

As the Genie continued her ministrations and her nipples kept growing Mia was growing a bit 
concerned. They were quickly going from “large” to “comically large”. These nips wouldn't be 
hidden by anything but the firmest of bras. Was this really what Chris found irresistible?

Her doubts were quickly overwhelmed by pleasure as the Genie's tongue and Mia's left hand 
played with her nipples and her right hand was pleasuring her pussy, it wouldn't be long before 
Mia had another orgasm at this rate but she wasn't expecting the Genie to slide one of her 
hands down her back and a guttural moan was pushed out of Mia as the Genie started groping 
her expanded and sensitive ass.

It was all just too much as Mia started panting uncontrollably, her hips shuddering with nothing 
to push against as so many points of stimulation pushed her over the edge into yet another 
strong orgasm. The Genie released her breast as her back arched and her pussy clamped 
down on her fingers.

“Oooohhhh ffffffuck!” Mia grunted as her orgasm washed over her, the Genie easing her down 
onto the bed, her work done. Mia lay there, chest heaving as she worked to get her breathing 
under control. Her eyes closed, nervous to see just how extreme the Genie's changes actually 
were this time.

The Genie waited patiently as Mia caught her breath, sighing as she started to push herself 
back up. Even with them being “only” C-cups Mia feels how her breasts shift as she gets up. On
top of them she can feel her nipples swaying as her breasts move. Once upright she takes 
another deep breath and opens her eyes. Looking down she quickly found her nipples. The 
darker skin really did stand out, her enlarged and still puffy areola covered an area almost 3 
inches across on each breast, nearly dominating the front of them. But the most drastic of all 
had to be her nipples themselves. 

They had continued to grow since she last got a good look at them, they were each about two 
and a half inches long and as thick as her thumb now. At least it seemed they were rock hard 
anymore, with a gravity pulling them into a slight droop. “Geeze…” Mia reached up and lightly 
pinched one of them, “Yup…still extra sensitive…” she muttered as she released them. At this 
rate Mia wasn't looking forward to trying to cram these in a bra, not that she had any big enough
for her new body to begin with of course.

“Are you sure this is what Chris wants?” Mia looked up and questioned the Genie, “I can't help 
but feel like the proportions going on here are really weird…” Mia motioned to her chest. The 
Genie nodded, “Yes currently it is a bit odd, but I am not done granting your wish yet, so let us 
take care of your mismatched proportions right away!” She declared, rising up and pushing Mia 



down onto her back.

“T-theres still m-more?” Mia stuttered as the Genie started crawling onto the bed Mia couldn't 
help but notice that the Genie's cock was once again rock hard and swaying about as the Genie
crawled on top of her.

“It is as you said, your proportions are a bit ‘weird’ as you said, so now we shall finish the job of 
enhancing your chest.” The Genie explained casually as she positioned herself over Mia, her 
cock hanging right above her chest. As it got closer the Genie's cock started to throb, the Genie 
was looking forward to this.

Honestly, Mia couldn't deny that she was excited as well, as crazy as all this was, every bit of it 
had felt amazing, especially the parts Mia hadn't expected to and her arousal got rolling once 
again in spite of basically just coming off the back of another amazing orgasm.

As the Genie lowered her cock between her breasts Mia felt the now familiar heat emanating 
from them even before it nestled in the valley between her breasts, gravity pulling them off to 
either side. Immediately she felt the flow of power once again, sighing softly as it flowed into her
chest. The Genie started to rotate her hips, slowly rubbing her cock up and down between her 
breasts.

“If I may, if you would push your breasts together it will be far more pleasurable for the both of 
us.” The Genie offered as she effortlessly straddled Mia and rocked her hips. Mia's first instinct 
was to scoff but the Genie's magic seemed to make almost her entire body into an erogenous 
zone, regardless of how sensitive it had been previously. “Oh ah…right!” Mia muttered as she 
brought her hands on to her chest. Carefully placing her fingers around her swollen nipples she 
slowly pushes them against the Genie's cock.

Mia moaned as the cock was embraced by her breasts. Not quite able to fully encompass the 
Genie's abnormally large member, the increased contact caused her arousal to spike as the 
heat and power flowed even more strongly from the increased contact. Looking down towards 
her chest Mia was enthralled as she watched the Genie titfuck her. As precum started to ooze 
out of the cock it was slowly spread to the inner parts of her breasts, giving them a slight shine 
and acting as lube and allowing the Genie to speed up.

The Genie was no longer just rocking her hips but genuinely starting to thrust her hips and work 
the entire length of her cock between her breasts. As the Genie found her rhythm Mia noticed 
that her fingers were being slowly being pushed apart as they squeezed her breasts together, 
her breasts were swelling up, slowly engulfing more and more of the Genie's thick cock.

“Oh Mia, your tits are so soft!” The genie moaned as she kept thrusting with long strokes given 
how little her C-Cups had been compared to the genie's wonderful cock.

Mia could only groan in response as she finally felt her breasts…no they were real tits now…as 
she felt her tits grow enough to touch around the genie's impressive girth. Mia spread her 
fingers out and roughly pushed them together, pushing against the cock pumping away. Her 



hands occupied Mia couldn’t finger her pussy and had to settle for grinding her thighs together 
to try and pleasure herself. Her tits kept growing, how big were they now, DDs? Es? It was 
impossible to tell with them squeezed around the Genie’s cock and through the haze of arousal.

Arousal that Mia wanted more of, her thighs were grinding away but it wasn’t enough, suddenly, 
she remembered her nipples, looking down she adjusted her hands, allowing her to use thumb 
and index finger to pinch, pull and tease her nipples as much as she could. Mia shuddered as 
she played with her sensitive nipples, easily sending her arousal into overdrive. Was the heat 
from the Genie being so close making it more pleasurable, were they just that sensitive now? 
Mia didn’t know and didn’t care at the moment. As her tits continued to swell the Genie was 
gradually shortening her strokes as more and more of her cock was engulfed by her tits. Mia 
also realized they weren’t just growing larger, but growing firmer too.

As Mia’s fingers played with her nipples, the rest of her fingers and hand were doing their best 
to grope her tits while mashing them against the Genie’s cock, and as they grew bigger Mia 
didn’t feel them flop around aimlessly as they got too big for her hands to hold. Instead she 
found them almost easier to handle than before, they retained enough give to feel amazing to 
grope but she figured they’d maintain that perfect “breast shape” even as they grew larger and 
larger.

And grow they did, quickly surpassing what her hands could easily manage, Mia focused on just
trying to keep them pressed against the Genie’s cock as the Genie moaned and groaned freely, 
she could feel her cock throbbing from between her breasts, although Mia wasn’t looking 
forward to the mess the genie would make of her chest and face if she came now. Mia looked 
up at the Genie, “Are you…going to…cum?” she panted out.

The Genie smirked as she continued titfucking Mia, “I would very much like to do so, but I'm 
saving that for the final act!” she giggled as she effortlessly thrust her cock between burgeoning 
tits, the head of her cock barely pushing past her cleavage before disappearing back into the 
depths of her cleavage as she pulled it back.

Mia groaned, her tits were getting so big she couldn't both play with her nipples and keep them 
pressed together, releasing her nipples she adjusted her hands to grasp as much of her tits as 
possible, grinding them against each other to try and replace some of the pleasure she had 
been getting from her nipples. The Genie cooed as the extra friction and rubbing teased her 
cock.

“Ah…you're just about…big enough now…unless you want…more?” the Genie teased Mia as 
her breasts continued to grow larger. Mia could only groan at the thought of her tits growing 
even bigger. Mia had gotten a bit distracted trying to pleasure herself, the sensations coming 
from her tits were great, but not enough to really bring her to orgasm, and between having to 
release her nipples and trying to grind her thighs together it just wasn't enough, would more 
help? Could it be enough? Mia's mind raced as the sparks of pleasure arced through her brain.

It wasn’t long until Mia made her choice, “MORE!” she cried out, desperate to increase her 
pleasure. The Genie giggled as she brought her hands down, laying them over Mia's as they 



worked to try and press as much of her tits together as she could. “I supposed a bit extra 
wouldn't hurt…” the Genie mused as she started to grope Mia's growing tits.

Mia shuddered and moaned under the Genie's ministrations, it felt amazing to play with herself, 
but having someone else pleasuring her was even better! The Genie's touch was electric and 
with every squeeze Mia felt the heat flowing into her chest building. Looking down Mia swore 
she could actually watch the growth happening to her tits.

“Yyyeeeessssss!” Mia moaned loudly, the Genie's breathing was growing ragged but Mia 
stopped paying attention as she slid her hands out from her the Genie's and slid them right to 
her pussy, one hand toying with her clit and the other jamming her fingers as deep as pleasure 
overloaded mind with handle. Her fingers slipped in easier, her pussy basically a fountain as she
was being driven to yet another orgasm.

“Fuck!...so close…” Mia groaned as she desperately tried to push herself over the edge. It was 
almost too much, it was all too chaotic. “Come ooooooon…” Mia muttered. Mia was so 
distracted by her own efforts she didn't notice the Genie slowly shifting her hands towardsher 
nipples as she continued groping her tits.

Mia yelped at the sudden rush of pleasure mixed with a touch of pain as the Genie pinched 
Mia’s swollen and sensitive nipples.. Mia’s pussy clenched as she looked down in time to watch 
as the Genie pulled back on her nipples, pulling her tits together and she kept fucking her tits 
with her cock.

Now unobstructed by either woman's hands she got a good look at just how big her tits had 
gotten. She couldn't begin to guess what letter of the alphabet her tits would measure as 
anymore, but they had to be damn near as big as volleyballs! Yet every time the Genie thrust 
her cock in between them it tugged on her nipples, repeatedly shooting pleasure right to Mia’s 
overwhelmed brain.

Mias was gasping and moaning with every ragged breath now, between her fingers in her pussy
and teasing her clit, the genie's firm hold on her nipples and the genie's thick cock tit fucking her
she had finally been pushed to the edge of orgasm before she was finally pushed her over the 
edge. Pleasure flooded her mind as her back arched and her pussy clamped down on her 
fingers as her orgasm finally broke through.

“Oh just in time, I wasn't going to last much longer…” Mia heard the Genie mumble as she 
pulled her hips back, fully removing her cock from her tits for the first time in what felt like hours 
but couldn't have been more than a few minutes. Her grip on Mia's nipples loosened but she 
didn't release them until Mia's orgasm had started to wane, her heavy breasts flopping to either 
side of her torso, firmer but still a slave to gravity to at least some degree it seemed.

Even as her orgasm wound down Mia just lay there for a bit, catching her breath and simply 
reveling in how amazing of an experience it had been. Pulling her hands from her crotch and 
just laying them on the bed she thought about how most of the guys she had been with could 
barely focus on more than one thing at a time during sex. Yet the Genie had just given her a 



glimpse of perfection by pleasuring her in so many ways at once. She couldn't help but worry 
that Chris wouldn't measure up after everything the Genie had done to her.

Taking a deep breath Mia opened her eyes and looked up at the Genie who had gotten up and 
was now just standing by the bed. “With these new anchors I think you're going to have to help 
me up.” Mia remarked. The Genie just shook her head, “There is no need, I wouldn't be so cruel
as to immobilize you Mia.” The genie's voice was dripping with mock surprise as if Mia had just 
accused her of wrongdoing.

“Alright alright, give me a moment…” Mia grumbled as she worked to prop herself up onto her 
elbows. True to her word Mia managed it easily enough, though she could still feel the heft of 
her new tits it didn't seem to stop her from moving around, their new weight threatening to throw
her off balance. Mia moved slowly as she got into a sitting position and planted her feet on the 
floor, looking down it seemed like all she could see was her tits, clearly now having grown 
slightly larger tha volleyballs in the final moments before her orgasm.

“I guess I'm going to need the mirror to see anything below my chest now…” Mia mumbled to no
one in particular as she pushed herself upright and took careful steps over to the mirror. Mia 
inhaled sharply as she got a look at her body, while her ass had been almost too big before, her 
new tits stole the spotlight now with just how massive they were, even on her new taller and 
filled out frame.

And yet…as Mia turned and posed in front of the mirror, she found that all together it actually…
kind of worked? Her nipples just looked a bit big compared to the size of her breasts, and while 
her hips and chest gave her a notable hourglass figure her stomach and waist had enough 
weight to them that with some baggy clothes she wouldn't stand out that much. I mean, her tits 
were still pretty extreme but even just not showing off her new cleavage would go a long way.

Turning to the Genie Mia immediately notes that she's still hard as a rock, and her cock is still 
throbbing slightly, Mia was basically showing herself off unintentionally for the last couple 
minutes. “Uh…that's it then, are you doing okay there?” Mia cautiously asked.

The Genie's cock throbbed, “I am fine, simply eager to grant the final portion of your wish.” The 
Genie explained, “all this has simply been foreplay to prepare you for the final act, are you 
ready?” The Genie asked, a lustful glint in her eyes as she waited for a response from Mia.

Mia swallowed nervously, how can there be anything left on her to grow still? I mean, if 
everything else had “simply” been foreplay, that would mean…her pussy? She was going to 
fuck her now? It wasn't that crazy, not like she had been “saving herself” for anyone, and the 
Genie had already fucked her in the ass. But it still felt like more than that now, the act of getting
fucked by someone as a means to give her a body that was irresistible to her crush suddenly 
seemed a lot more complicated.

Her eyes kept getting drawn down to the Genie's cock, it had felt amazing when she fucker her 
ass, even when she shrunk herself down at Mia's request, to say nothing of when she regained 
her full size. Mia couldn't really answer whether or not this felt like cheating on someone who 



barely knew her at the moment, but something she did know is that she realized just how badly 
she wanted that cock in her, and how much the Genie clearly wanted it as well.

Mia nervously cleared her throat before finally answering, “Um…yeah I'm ready, you're clearly 
ready too but uh…can I make a request?” Mia asked shyly. The Genie tilted her head a bit, “A 
request? Do you need me to return to a more suitable size once again?” She started to raise her
hand and bring her fingers together to snap them.

“OH no no no, I um…want you at your current size actually, I was just wondering if, maybe I 
could be on top?” Mia couldn't look the other woman in the eyes, her cheeks flushing with 
embarrassment no doubt as she asked the mythical being before her to let her take control.

The Genie lowered her hand as she smiled, “Of course Mia! It is your wish after all!” She 
stepped up alongside Mia and leaned forward, “How do you want to take me?” The Genie 
whispered in her ear, Mia's knees nearly buckling with just how sensual her voice was this 
close. And with her standing so close Mia also realized that although the Genie had made Mia 
the same height as her, she had grown all of her assets to be larger than the genie's own.

“Uh well, normally I like sitting in a guy's lap but I think with our…uh assets…that won't work so 
well. How about you just get on your back and then I can drop down onto you?” Mia suggested 
as she could also feel the tingle of a newly kindled arousal growing in her pussy.

“I would love to do that for you Mia.” The Genie purred as she stepped towards the bed. Mia 
hadn't really noticed it before but she moved with such grace, it was almost like she never 
touched the ground. As if reading her mind as the genie came up to the edge of the bed she 
turned and gently floated towards the center of it before lowering herself down onto the bed.

The genie's cock stood tall and proud, still hard despite it having been several minutes since 
she removed it from Mia's cleavage, though it was still slick, a thin coat of the genie's precum 
smeared all over the cock, and Mia's cleavage too. Carefully climbing onto the bed sparks of 
pleasure forced a small moan from Mia as their large breasts rubbed together as she stepped 
over the Genie. 

The genie raised her knees up, “Here Mia, don't push yourself too hard.” gently pushing them 
against Mia’s ass to encourage her. Pushing herself upright Mia leaned back against the 
Genie's thighs for support. A downside to her new tits quickly became apparent as she couldn't 
really see past them without leaning forward or twisting around awkwardly.

She eventually lay eyes on her prize, the Genie's huge cock, she had barely managed to avoid 
touching it when she pushed herself upright, even now her cock was almost level with her 
pussy. Mia gulped as she sized it up, while she was confident that her wish and the Genie 
granting it would make sure that her pussy would be up to the task of taking the entire length of 
the Genie’s cock, Mia was still a bit worried about the early stages of mounting the Genie.

Reaching down she gently grasped it right below the head, her skin was soft and just a bit 
slippery from being coated in her own precum. The genie moaned softly as Mia gave it a few 



short strokes, she'd never handled a cock as amazing as the Genie's. Pulling it towards her she 
gently pulled it against her pussy, starting to coat it in her own fluids this time she slowly teased 
the both of them as she worked up the courage to push it inside her.

Mia can already feel the heat being infused into her pussy and the Genie's power flowing into 
her as she slowly rubbed her pussy against the Genie's length. Taking a deep breath Mia aimed 
the Genie's cockhead into her pussy and slowly brought her hips down, moaning quietly as the 
Genie's cockhead spready her lips wide, its girth unlike any other cock she'd ever handled 
before.

Finally the cockhead slipped inside her and she stopped moving, taking the time to let her pussy
adapt, and to take in more of the Genie's power that would undoubtedly result in her pussy 
being more able to swallow the rest of the cock no with no problems.

“Sorry, just need a moment…” Mia apologized quietly, she could now feel the Genie's cock 
throbbing and pushing against her insides.

“It's all right, take your time.” The Genie whispered before reaching her hands up, as her hands 
reached her inner thighs the Genie started to lightly massage them, prompting more moans 
from Mia as the Genie's fingers teased her. With Mia's arousal being stoked by the Genie it 
wasn’t long until Mia’s desire overwhelmed her caution and she started to lower herself onto the
Genie's cock.

Mia hisses as her pussy stretches around the Genie's cock, the Genie herself groaning as Mia's
pussy swallows four more inches before she has to stop again. “Fuck…you're so big, it's 
amazing.” Mia gasps, “And you are wonderfully tight Mia!” the genie replies as she continues 
working her hands along Mia's inner thighs, Mia suspects both to help her relax and as an outlet
for the Genie's own lust.

With some of the Genie's cock now inside her Mia feels the heat flowing into her freely now. 
Even with how big the Genie was and how stretched out Mia was she hadn't felt any resistance,
her soaked pussy seemed to lubricate itself more than enough for half of the Genie's length to 
slip inside.

Trusting in the process she started to lower herself some more, her pussy swallowing more and 
more until finally she groaned as their crotches came together. Mia wiggled her hips back and 
forth, the sensation of something so large pushing so deep into her and stretching out her pussy
was amazing, she could feel the cock's every pulse, twitch and throb.

“Well done Mia, is my cock penetrating you to your satisfaction?” The Genie asks with a smirk, 
clearly knowing the answer but wanting to hear Mia say it nonetheless.

“Yeeeesssss…” Mia slurred slightly as she basked in the sensations of being impaled by such a 
fine cock. The Genie pulled her hands back and lowered her legs as Mia adjusted her position 
on top of the other woman, each shift sending a pulse of pleasure up her spine. Her pussy 
stretched tightly around the Genie's cock and her ass grinded into the genie's thighs as she got 



comfortable.

“I'm going to start moving now…” Mia breathed as her pussy seemed to adapt to the Genie’s 
size. She felt the Genie's cock jerk in anticipation as the Genie only smiled back at her. Mia 
started to push herself up, slowly pulling more and more of the thick cock out of her. Even after 
waiting to try and adapt to the cocks sheer size and girth it still felt like she was turning herself 
inside out. Mia groaned as she felt the edges of the genie's cockhead pushing against her 
pussy lips from inside. Only one thing left to do now Mia though as she relaxed her legs and felt 
herself drop back down.

Mia threw her head back as the cock filled her completely and her ass slammed back into the 
genie's thighs, moaning loudly she swore her vision blurred for a moment just from how intense 
it was. Even the stone faced genie moaned as she was thrust deep into Mia's pussy. Wanting…
no…needing more of that feeling Mia pushed herself upwards again and this time she simply let
herself drop down.

This time both of them moaned loudly, but the slapping of ass on thighs was still louder. Mia 
kept going, each time her new assets shook and jiggled wildly which only encouraged her to do 
it all over again.

Unfortunately even with whatever the Genie did to her that let her handle her new figure, it 
seemed to have its limits, it wasn't long until Mia felt her muscles start to struggle and burn, her 
breathing growing ragged as her body slowed down, no long able to raise herself high enough 
to get a full stroke out of the Genie’s cock.

With one final pitiful thrust Mia slumps forward, barely catching herself as she gasps for breath. 
“I'm sorry…I guess I'm just….really worn out…” Mia struggles to apologize as her tits hanged 
down, lightly brushing against the Genie's. As she works to catch her breath she jumps a little 
bit as she feels the Genie's hands slowly circling around her hips.

“Nonsense Mia, you have had a very…stimulating evening, it's only natural that you feel a little 
tired!” The Genie reassured her as she started really working her fingers into Mia's hips which 
felt as amazing as everything else the Genie had done to her tonight.

“Let me help you here at the end.” The Genie offered as she grabbed Mia's hips, driving a groan
from Mia as the genie started to lift her hips up, Mia could feel the Genie's cock scrapping along
her insides. The Genie moved her slowly, much to Mia's surprise, moving her hips in a sort of 
slow circle, brushing her cock against spots inside Mia's pussy that she'd never felt before, 
sparks of pleasure shooting up her spine.

“F…Fuck you're so good at this this!” Mia moaned as the Genie started to pick up speed, her 
pussy quickly becoming a blazing inferno of heat and pleasure. The Genie laughed softly, “Well I
have had a lot of practice…” a comment that would have made perfect sense had Mia's mind 
not been under an erotic assault for the past hour as the Genie worked to grant her wish.

Mia's arms started to shake as the Genie ravaged her. Knowing that they'd give out soon she 



instead opted to lower herself down, it wasn't smooth but it was better than just dropping down 
at least. As their tits pressed together Mia moaned, her rock hard nipples pressing into the 
genie's flesh and slowly being ground together as the Genie continued moving her hips for her.

The Genie didn't let up on Mia’s pussy, each movement of her hips brought Mia to new heights 
of pleasure. Amazingly Mia didn't feel nearly as stretched out anymore, the Genie’s cock slid 
smoothly in and out her her as they continued to fuck, Mia's own juices, mixed with the Genie’s 
precum, continued to ooze out around the Genie’s cock with every thrust but Mia's attention was
now of the Genie's face, not since their initial kiss has she been able to just look at the Genie 
and appreciate her true beauty.

Or at least that's what Mia wanted to do but Mia's brain was basically mush from all the pleasure
the Genie was giving her. Now that her massive nipples were grinding against the Genie’s tit 
flesh she was reaching her limit, simply too much pleasure from too many places.

“Fuck…too much…gonna…cum!” Mia gasped out between the Genie's thrusts.

“Do it! I'm ready for you Mia!” The Genie encouraged her, almost cutting herself off as she 
groaned from a particularly deep thrust.

Thrust

Mia could feel how the Genie’s cock was throbbing, pulsing, pushing against her insides, 
pushing her towards the edge.

Thrust

The Genie’s grip on her hips tightened, her breathing started to get a bit forced after spending 
the whole encounter calm and collected.

Thrust

Mia’s arms were jelly, just enough strength to keep her from falling off from on top of the Genie 
as her nipples rubbed against the Genie’s tits.

Thrust

Mia was at the edge now, as the Genie pulled her hips upward for the last time Mia leaned 
forward and kissed the genie on her plump lips. The Genie held her there for a moment longer 
to kiss her back briefly before…

Thrust

The Genie slammed Mia’s hips down and finally pushed her over the edge. Time seemed to 
crawl for Mia as her orgasm seemed to explode within her. It felt overwhelming but even as the 
wave of pleasure crashed through her body Mia realized she wasn’t feeling any more pleasure, 



but rather she could take the time to enjoy all aspects of it.

The way her nipples were dragged along the Genie’s tits as her hips were slammed down, the 
pressure on her hips from the Genie's hands, but most of all, the way the Genie’s glorious cock 
spread her pussy wide as inch after inch invaded her depths. She could feel every vein, the 
crest of her glans and even the way it pulsed and throbbed in time with the genie’s heart beat.

Finally she felt the genie’s crotch reach her own, Mia hadn’t been able to see what changes had
been going on to her pussy past her new rack, but she had felt a bit swollen, but now as time 
stretched long she was able to feel it, her nether lips how grown, and that’s where she felt the 
contact first. Then she felt the pressure as the Genie’s crotch kept pushing in order to bury 
every possible bit of her cock into Mia.

The Genie held her hips down, even slowly grinding the women’s crotches together. As her 
orgasm continued to crash through her body Mia felt her back tensing up, slightly arching her 
back as the pleasure inched closer to her brain.

Suddenly Mia felt something new, The Genie’s hips were jerking rhythmically, the Genie was 
cumming. Mia felt the cock that she was impaled on push ever so slightly more against her 
insides, straining as sudden;y she felt the genie’s urethra swell as the base as her first shot of 
cum traveled upward, it felt excruciatingly slow to Mia’s new perception but she grew excited 
with every inch it pushed along the Genie’s cock, drawing closer and closer to release.

Finally the Genie’s cum reached the end of it’s journey and was shot out, Mia felt it spread 
across her insides, coating more and more as the Genie pumped shot after shot into Mia’s 
pussy, it seems the Genie’s orgasms are just as amazing as the rest of her. Just as Mia felt the 
Genie’s orgasm start to wane she felt her cum starting to ooze out of her pussy from the sheer 
volume the Genie had pumped inside her.

The wave of Mia’s orgasm finally reached the top of her spine and flooded into her brain, it was 
simultaneously a familiar feeling and like nothing she’d ever experienced before. Pleasure lit up 
every part of her brain as her voice failed her, her vision blurred front the raw intensity and 
pussy pulsed as if trying to milk every last drop from the Genie’s cock.

Finally her orgasm started to recede, slowly at first but quickly winding down faster and faster as
Mia realized her perception was returning to normal, heart pounding and breathing ragged, it 
was all she could do to not just completely flop down onto the Genie. For her part the Genie 
seemed almost as drained as Mia felt and she could feel the Genie’s cock going soft inside her. 
The Genie gently raised her hips and it wasn;t long before she felt the soft member slip out of 
her, landing on the Genie’s belly with a wet plop.

Shifting her a bit to the side the Genie eased her down to the bed and Mia just flopped down. 
Once safely deposited to the bed the Genie turned onto her side and propped herself up on an 
elbow.

“You were amazing Mia, how are you feeling?” the Genie asked, genuine care clearly present.



Having mostly caught her breath Mia swallowed, “Amazing is one way to put it but I feel like I 
can’t describe what you did to me with mere words…” Mia answered unhelpfully.

Mia took another deep breath, “Easy does it…” Mia mumbled as she slowly pushed herself up 
to her feet.

“Take care Mia, you are rather worn out.” the Genie remarked as she got up and followed Mia 
as she moved towards the mirror.

“I’ll be careful, I just need to see what you did to me this time, couldn’t see anything past my 
chest…” Mia explained as she found herself in front of the mirror. Looking downward her eyes 
fell upon her pussy and Mia gasped under her breath. Swollen didn’t do it justice, her lips 
weren’t just swollen, they were just flat out bigger as well. Much to her surprise her pussy wasn’t
gaping after taking the Genie's huge cock, it seems like her pussy getting loose wouldn’t be a 
problem for Mia anymore. Also of note was her clit, even post-orgasm and with swollen lips her 
clit just barely poked out, Mia couldn’t help but wonder if it swelled up more now when aroused. 
Mia groaned quietly as a realization hit her, she basically had permanent camel two to deal with 
now.

The Genie stepped up beside her, “Now that your wish has been granted, what do you think 
Mia?” her curiosity was clearly earnest.

Mia had to step back and crouch down a bit to see all of herself in the mirror as she took 
everything all in together for the first time.

“I won’t lie, it’s just…a lot.” Mia began, no longer worried about the Genie being vengeful at this 
point. “Sometimes it felt like too much and it left me looking like a freak, like when you grew my 
nipples.” Mia continued, “But it all felt amazing, your hands-on approach really helped to ease 
me into the changes.” Mia glanced at the Genie and swore she saw her blush. “But seeing it 
and feeling it all together now, it's a lot, but it’s also incredible and now it feels right.”

Mia spun around quickly, “It is a bit extreme, I basically look like some kind of fetish artist’s wet 
dream but I guess that was the point in the end, although I maybe didn’t realize it fully at the 
beginning.” Mia mused. Turning back to the Genie she found that the Genie had returned to the 
state Mia had first met her in, her cock was gone and she was wearing her sheer robes again.

The genie smiled, seemingly content with Mia’s answer. She leaned forward, “Now then Mia, 
what is your next wish?”


